
Summer Term Class Griffin - Homework Grid 

Dungeons and Dragons 

Please remember to read at home with your child and practice any spellings and times 

tables (2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 8 and 10). In addition, please choose one piece of homework each 

week to complete. Make sure you choose homework from different sections of the grid 

and hand one piece in each Monday. 

Language, 

Literacy and 

Communication 

 

Read a Welsh myth from the 
Mabinigion and write a description of 
the main character. Maybe adding an 
image too.  
 
 

Write a series of sentences including 
dialogue describing something about 
Wales. Remember the punctuation 

(speech marks, 
commas, question 
marks etc…) and a 
new line for each 
new person who 
speaks. 
 
 

Cymraeg 

 

Improve your Welsh vocabulary by 
visiting the Campau Cosmig app.  

Use the Hapus app to practise talking 
in the past tense and about yourselves 
and interests in Welsh. 
 
 

Expressive Arts 

 

Can you make a model of a castle using 
recyclable items? Or paint a picture of 
a Welsh castle. 
 

Can you create a picture of a dragon 
this could be in paint, collage, mixed 
media, on the computer or pencil. 
 
            

          

Science and 

Technology 

Can you find out about an insect and 
draw and label their life cycle. Writing 
about each stage of its development. 

                        

Use your IT skills to make a 
promotional leaflet about Powys Castle 
for the National Trust. 
 

This Photo by Unknown 

This Photo by Unknown 

https://freepngimg.com/png/10315-castle-png
https://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc/3.0/
https://www.antiquesandteacups.info/2015/03/tuesday-cuppa-tea-st-davids-day-shelley.html
https://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc-nd/3.0/


 

If you have any creative ideas of your own which you would like to do one week instead of doing 

one of the projects that’s fine. Any word processing, photos, PPTs or other ICT based learning 

needs to be uploaded onto your Hwb folder. 

Please remember your Hwb folders are where you store your home or school based digital 

learning only. 

 

You need to remember to leave a brief comment for the teacher each time you upload or do 

some homework on Hwb otherwise we don’t know you have been busy doing extra learning! 

 

We look forward to seeing your wonderful creations! 

 

Mathematics 

and Numeracy 

 

 
 

Practice telling the time (O’clock, half 
past, quarter to/past and the 5-minute 
intervals). 
Try the following web links. 
Telling the Time - Mathsframe 
Match the Times – 5-11-year-olds - 
Topmarks 
Splashlearn 
 
 

Collect some data either from your 
family or made up and create a table 
and block graph of the results. Then 
add some questions about the graph 
for your friends to answer. 
 

Humanities 

 

Can you design your own village and 
add features and a key explaining these 
features. Maybe you could add a grid 
so that you could include coordinates 
to find places on your map. 
 

       

Write a description of a castle 
including lots of detail about its 
location, features, what it is made of, 
turrets, gates, moat etc. This could be 
in the form of a non-chronological 
report, a fantasy description, or a 
PowerPoint presentation. 
 

           
 

Health and 

Wellbeing 

 

Can you follow a traditional Welsh 
recipe, making a list of instructions and 
taking images for your recipe to share 
with the class. 
 

 
 

Create a Family Tree. 
You will need to ask different family 
members to help you with it. See how 
far back you can go. 
 

https://mathsframe.co.uk/en/resources/resource/116/telling_the_time
https://www.topmarks.co.uk/Flash.aspx?f=matchingpairstimev3
https://www.topmarks.co.uk/Flash.aspx?f=matchingpairstimev3
https://freepngimg.com/png/89723-baking-human-cooking-behavior-mother-reading
https://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc/3.0/

